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Comprised of smart, highly adaptable men and women, the Marine Corps serves as the aggressive tip of the
U.S. military spear. Theirs is a smaller, more dynamic force than any other in the American arsenal, and the
only forward-deployed force designed for expeditionary operations by air, land, or sea. It is their size and
expertise that allow them to move faster. Working to overcome disadvantage and turn conflict into victory,
they accomplish great things, and they do so together. In the Marine Corps, there is a motto that describes
their commitment to each other, their organization, and their country. It is Semper Fidelis or "Semper Fi."
Translated from Latin, it means "Always Faithful."- Superb full-color action photos- Behind the scenes look
at the training and structure- Next book in the colorful and successful series covering America's military
forces- Still one of America's most combat efficient forcesFeatures:Chronological photographic displays,
with personal stories, of a class of recruits as they progress through Marine recruit training.Steve Tomajczyk
gains unprecedented access to the men in training around the country, including California, North Carolina,
Virginia, and Okinawa.Superb full-color action photos.Author Steve Tomajczyk takes you through Marine
recruit training - "Boot Camp" - the 13-week process that transforms a young person with the courage to
succeed into a mature, highly disciplined, and fully capable Marine. During this time drill instructors teach
individuals how to care for themselves and others, function as a member of a team and to achieve success
together. Training includes first aid, water survival skills, marksmanship, tactics and other related topics.
Training also focuses on customs, traditions and history that have made the Marine Corps respected around
the world.About the AuthorS.F. Tomajczyk has written numerous books on weapons, agencies, and other
aspects of the U.S. military and warfare, including Black Hawk, Bomb Squads, and Carrier Battle Group.
Tomajczyk lives in Loudon, New Hampshire.
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From reader reviews:

Leo Rizer:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different
to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want
to try out look for book, may be the book untitled To Be a U.S. Marine can be good book to read. May be it
may be best activity to you.

Meagan Shaffer:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get lots of stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of
activity are you experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout
spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is actually To Be a U.S. Marine.

Lucy Nelson:

To Be a U.S. Marine can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We recommend that straight
away because this reserve has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to get every word
into enjoyment arrangement in writing To Be a U.S. Marine but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be among it. This great
information may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial pondering.

Laurie Cales:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this To Be a U.S. Marine e-book written
by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who also
read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate
your current hunger then you still uncertainty To Be a U.S. Marine as good book not simply by the cover but
also from the content. This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you
so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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