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The lives of thousands of people have been influenced by Gangaji's teachings. You Are That is a collection of
her classic offerings, first shared more than a decade ago and now updated to include both original volumes,
a new introduction, rare photographs, and new insights. This exquisite special edition delves into natural
inquiries about our existence, including the nature of mind, how to expose the core of suffering, and how to
overcome the last obstacle of self-doubt.

Eloquent and direct, Gangaji guides practitioners of all backgrounds through an examination into the self that
often leads to unexpected glimpses of awakening. "This is a moment of reckoning," she teaches.

"Do not take this moment casually or trivially. Recognize that for whatever reason, you are aware of the
possibility of realizing the truth of yourself as limitless consciousness—you are that!"
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From reader reviews:

Eva Dawson:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book You Are That. You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book You Are That. You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book
you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple
matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a book or even searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's go through.

Bernice Hicks:

The book You Are That give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting tension or having big
problem with the subject. If you can make reading a book You Are That to become your habit, you can get
far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects.
You are able to know everything if you like available and read a guide You Are That. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Rona Foret:

This You Are That book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit
you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get facts
which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This particular You Are That
without we comprehend teach the one who examining it become critical in contemplating and analyzing.
Don't possibly be worry You Are That can bring if you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn
into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This You Are That having
good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Sylvia Medina:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book You Are That to make your own
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to
choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book and
looking at especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that
the guide You Are That can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what
must you're doing of their time.
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